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Revisiting the West coast of Ireland after nearly 30 years was both inspirational as well as daunting. 
I spent many road trips and holidays with my Irish father from Belfast covering hundreds of miles 
as the passenger, unable to engage fully with the landscape as an artist. This recent visit enabled 
me a chance to reclaim those memories and produce new work. I am drawn to the details and 
avoid the horizon, I avoid the picturesque and celebrate the beauty in the macrocosm, the love of 
nature’s secrets combined with my love of paint come together in the studio to celebrate in art. 
 
My work is not abstract in the formal sense, but it has enjoyed the relationship with ambiguity; it 
is concerned with inner emotion and the sensed experience of the viewer; it is about the 
contemplative and experience of self-reflection. All my work has endeavored to present the clarity, 
yet simultaneous abstraction of a ‘peripheral’ experience: the afterimage burnt onto the retina, 
something which is both precise yet ambiguous, fixed yet transitory, permanent yet ephemeral. 
 

                              
 
My work allows for the materiality and physicality of the earth itself to take on a more significant 
role. The first response to these works is that of a physical one, paint itself and process of its 
making is primary. The work allows for the personal, philosophical and the emotive, as well as the 
sense of journey and time. 



 
I aspire to celebrate nature’s ability to seep absorbed light, almost as liquid colour when dusk sets. 
These works ‘re-present’ that connection with our natural world, the most simplest and 
fundamental of human experiences: they give one time to breath.  The sculptural encounter with 
the painting engenders the consistent underlying melodic whisper of the spiritual that has 
developed in my work.  
 

                                    
 
These works refract human presence; they make one aware of themselves, openly revealing one’s 
own fragility of existence and sense of being human. They are sensuous and seductive, they allow 
the eyes to experience the sense of touch, to smell or taste colour, they celebrate beauty. 
 
It is both microcosm and macrocosm simultaneously, they allow the viewer to exchange their own 
scale; the distance established between the viewer’s retina and picture plane oscillates between 
near and far. This whole experience enhances an important factor, that of ‘time’. There is an 
extraordinary sense of quiet, calm and stillness. Time held in suspension. I hope that all of my 
works allow the viewer to become highly conscious of the activity of looking, and therefore to 
become aware of oneself, one’s own position in time and place, to recognize almost outside of 
oneself one’s own presence.  
 
To breathe in memory, thought, serenity, time and contemplation. When I ask myself once again, 
what is the point of making? What does my work do? The point is quite simply to create a work, 
which allows thought itself to breathe. 
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